
 
 

 
 
Memorandum to: Staff in the University Operations and Real Estate Partnerships portfolio 

Governing Council 
   Academic Board 
   Business Board 
   University Affairs Board 
   UTM Campus Council 
   UTSC Campus Council 
   Principals, Deans, Academic Directors and Chairs 
   Professional and Managerial Staff 
    Confidential Staff 
   President of UTFA 
   Presidents of Employee Unions 
   Presidents of APUS, GSU, SCSU, UTMSU and UTSU 
 
From:   Professor Meric Gertler, President 
 
Date:   December 15, 2022 
 
Re:   Extension of the term of Scott Mabury as Vice-President, Operations 

and Real Estate Partnerships and Vice-Provost, Academic Operations 
  ______________________________________________________________________________ 

 
I am pleased to announce that the Governing Council has approved the extension of the term of 
Professor Scott Mabury as Vice-President, Operations and Real Estate Partnerships, as well as 
his term as Vice-Provost, Academic Operations, to June 30, 2026.   
 
In January 2019 the Governing Council approved the appointment of Professor Mabury in the 
newly created position of Vice-President, Operations and Real Estate Partnerships. The term of 
the appointment was from January 1, 2019 until June 30, 2023. At that time, it also approved the 
extension of his term as Vice-Provost, Academic Operations to June 30, 2023.   
  
Professor Mabury has been a strong and visionary leader of the large and complex Operations 
and Real Estate Partnerships portfolio. The extension of his term ensures that the University 
maintains momentum and maximizes opportunities to complete major initiatives currently 
underway. In addition, with the extension of my appointment by two years to June 30, 2025, it 
also will afford my successor a smooth transition in this key leadership position. 
 
Since joining the Vice-Presidential team in 2012 as Vice-President, University Operations, 
Professor Mabury has had a transformative impact on the fabric of the University of Toronto. 
Some of his more recent accomplishments include the approval of the St. George Secondary 
Plan, the launch of the Climate Positive Campus Plan (which has positioned the St. George 
campus as an emerging post-secondary leader in sustainability), securing a partnership with the 

 

 

https://governingcouncil.utoronto.ca/system/files/2021-08/Mabury%20VP%20Univ%20Op%20and%20Real%20Estate%20Partnerships%20Jan2019.pdf
https://climatepositive.utoronto.ca/
https://www.utoronto.ca/news/u-t-partners-canada-infrastructure-bank-boost-climate-positive-efforts
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Canadian Infrastructure Bank (CIB), and the Landmark Project (which is slated for completion in 
2023).  He has also provided leadership with regard to the financial health and sustainability of 
the University, information technology and information security, and institutional data.  
Another signal achievement has been the establishment and implementation of the University’s 
Four Corners real estate strategy. With the extension of his term, Professor Mabury will be well 
positioned to work with me to shape the further growth, consolidation and leadership of this 
significant component of his portfolio, ensuring its long-term success.  
 
I am deeply grateful to Professor Mabury for his outstanding service to the University, and for 
his willingness to continue in this critical leadership role. 
 

 
 

 

https://www.utoronto.ca/news/u-t-partners-canada-infrastructure-bank-boost-climate-positive-efforts
https://landmark.utoronto.ca/

